
S U B O R D I N A T E  L E G I S L A T I O N  

2016 No. 19 

THE NATIONAL HEALTH SERVICE (WALES) ACT 

2006 

Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of 

Financial Entitlements (Amendment) (No. 4) Directions 2016 

Made - - - - 16 August 2016 

Coming into force - - 17 August 2016 

The Welsh Ministers in exercise of the powers conferred on them by sections 45, 203(9) and (10) 

and 204(1) of the National Health Service (Wales) Act 2006(a), and after consulting in accordance 

with section 45(4) of that Act with the bodies appearing to them to be representative of persons to 

whose remuneration these Directions relate give the following Directions: 

Title, commencement and application 

1.—(1) The title of these Directions is the Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement 

of Financial Entitlements (Amendment) (No. 4) Directions 2016. 

(2) These Directions are given to Local Health Boards(b) and apply in relation to Wales. 

(3) These Directions come into force on 17 August 2016 but have effect from 1 April 2016. 

Amendments to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

2. The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

Directions 2013(c) which came into force on 11 June 2013, as amended by the Directions listed in 

Annex J at Schedule 1 to these Directions, are further amended as follows. 

Amendment of Section 7  

3. Section 7 (childhood immunisations) is amended as follows — 

(a) in paragraph 7.10 (calculation of quarterly two-year-olds immunisation payments), for 

“63” in each place where it appears, substitute “65”; and 

(b) in paragraph 7.20 (calculation of quarterly five-year-olds immunisation payments), for 

“64” in each place where it appears, substitute “62”. 

Amendment of Section 8  

4. In Section 8 (rotavirus vaccine), in paragraph 8.3 (payment for administration of rotavirus 

vaccine), for “£7.80” substitute “£9.80”. 

                                                                                                                                       
(a) The National Health Service (Wales) Act 2006 (c.42). 

(b) Local Health Boards established pursuant to section 11 of the National Health Service (Wales) Act 2006. 
(c) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 2013 (2013 No.8) as amended. 



 2 

Amendment of Section 9  

5. Section 9 (pneumococcal vaccine and Hib/MenC booster vaccine)  is amended as follows- 

(a) in paragraphs 9.3, 9.6, 9.8, 9.9(b), 9.10, 9.11 and 9.12, for “£15.28” substitute “£19.60”; 

and 

(b) in paragraph 9.15, for “£15.10” substitute “£19.60”.  

Amendment of Section 10  

6. Section 10 (shingles immunisation programme) is amended as follows- 

(a) in paragraph 10.2 (payment for administration of the Shingles vaccine), for “£7.80” 

substitute “£9.80”; and 

(b) in paragraph 10.5 (eligibility for payment), for “£7.80” substitute “£9.80”. 

Substitution of Annex I  

7. For the table in Annex I (routine childhood vaccines and immunisations), substitute the 

following table. 

 

Table  

When to immunise What vaccine is given How it is 

given 

 

Two months old Diphtheria, tetanus, pertussis (whooping cough), 

polio and Haemophilus influenzae type b 

(DTaP/IPV/HiB) 
 

Pneumococcal (PCV) 
 

Rotavirus (Rota) 

One injection 
 

 

One injection 
 

One oral 

dose 
  

Three months old Diphtheria, tetanus, pertussis (whooping cough) 

polio and Haemophilus influenza type b 

(DTaP/IPV/HiB) 
 

Rotavirus (Rota) 

One injection 
 

 

One oral dose 

 

Four months old Diphtheria, tetanus, pertussis (whooping cough) 

polio and Haemophilus influenza type b 

(DTaP/IPV/HiB) 
 

Pneumococcal (PCV) 

One injection 
 

 

One injection 

 

Around twelve 

months 

Haemophilus influenza type b, Men C 

(Hib/MenC) 
 

Measles, mumps and rubella (MMR) 
 

Pneumococcal (PCV) 

One injection 
 

One injection 
 

One injection 

 

Three years four Diphtheria, tetanus, pertussis (whooping cough) One injection 



 3 

months to five 

years old 

and polio (dTaP/IPV or DTap/IPV) 
 

Measles, mumps and rubella (MMR) 

 

 

One injection 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Signed by Dr Grant L. Duncan, Deputy Director, Primary Care Division under the authority of the 

Cabinet Secretary for Health, Well-being and Sport, one of the Welsh Ministers 

 

Date   16 August 2016 

 

 

 



 SCHEDULE 1 Direction 2 

ANNEX J 

Amendments to the Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement 

of Financial Entitlements Directions 2013 which came into force on 11 

June 2013 

(a) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) Directions 2013 (2013 No.60), which were made on 30 September 2013. 

(b) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) Directions 2014 (2014 No.3), which were made on 16 June 2014. 

(c) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) (No. 2) Directions 2014 (2014 No.17), which were made on 27 June 2014. 

(d) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) (No. 3) Directions 2014 (2014 No.24), which were made on 30 September 

2014. 

(e) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) Directions 2015 (2015 No.7), which were made on 31 March 2015. 

(f) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment No 2) Directions 2015 (2015 No.14), which were made on 01 April 2015. 

(g) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment No 3) Directions 2015 (2015 No.15), which were made on 20 April 2015 

(h) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment No 4) Directions 2015 (2015 No.19), which were made on 25 June 2015 

(i) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) (No.5) Directions 2015, which were made on 30 September 2015. 

(j) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) Directions 2016, which were made on 30 March 2016. 

(k) (The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) (No. 2) Directions 2016, which were made on 11 April 2016. 

(l) The Directions to Local Health Boards as to the Statement of Financial Entitlements 

(Amendment) (No. 3) Directions 2016, which were made on 13 July 2016. 

 


