#### Dear

### ATISN 17028 - Covid Dashboard

Thank you for your request to the Welsh Government for information under the Freedom of Information Act (2000) received on 09 January 2023. You have requested the following:

To provide an updated version of the dashboard provided in Sep 2022 for the Welsh Government Covid Nosocomial Investigations including:

- split by health board and NHS run care homes from March 2020 to Dec 2022
- split by investigations into deaths vs infections
  - 1. Completed investigations
  - 2. Downgraded
  - 3. Recategorised
  - 4. Referred to Scrutiny panel
  - 5. In progress
  - 6. Not started
- To confirm the frequency that each HB and care home provide the Welsh Gov with this information and the last reporting period?

## **Our Response**

The most recent dashboard data held by the Welsh Government which covers the period up to November 2022 is attached below. The table includes the total number of cases to be investigated, investigations not started, investigations in progress and the number of investigations completed up to the end of November 2022.

The Welsh Government does not hold data on downgraded or recategorised cases, or cases referred to scrutiny panel, or cases in NHS funded care homes. The Welsh Government does not hold data split by investigations into deaths versus infections.

The NHS Delivery Unit updates the Welsh Government monthly. The data below is the most up to date information currently held by the Welsh Government. The next update is due at the end of January 2023 which will include data up to the end of December 2022.

# National Position to 30 November 2022 - waves 1 - 4

Organisation	Total Cases	Not Started	In Progress	Completed	Remaining Cases
Anuerin Bevan University Health Board	2560	2080	138	342	2218
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board	3658	2485	261	912	2746
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board	3231	2043	238	950	2281
Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board	3233	1969	762	502	2731
Hywel Dda University Health Board	2320	1337	822	161	2159
Powys Teaching Health Board	297	114	63	120	177
Swansea Bay University Health Board	2857	2154	319	384	2473
Velindre NHS Trust	27	0	9	18	9
Overall	18183	12182	2612	3389	14794

# **Next steps**

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government's handling of your request, you can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response. Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government's Freedom of Information Officer at:

Information Rights Unit, Welsh Government, Cathays Park, Cardiff, CF10 3NQ

or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House,

Water Lane,

Wilmslow,

Cheshire,

SK9 5AF.

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it has been through our own internal review process.

Yours sincerely